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Complexity at Hamoukar during the Fourth Millennium BC: A View from Seals and Sealings” 
at the Third International Conference on the Archaeology of the Ancient Near East in Paris 
(April 2002); “Political Changes versus Cultural Continuity? The Case of Eshnunna between 
Ur III and Isin/Larsa,” read in New York in the Ancient Near Eastern Seminar at Columbia 
University and at the Harvard Semitic Museum (February 2002); and “Eshnunna’s ‘Birth as a 
State’: From Ur III Province to Independence,” read at the History Department of University 
College London (May 2002).

In June 2002 he submitted his article “Administrative Complexity in Syria during the 
Fourth Millennium B.C.: the Seals and Sealings from Tell Hamoukar,” to the journal Akkadica, 
together with articles by McGuire Gibson, Tony J. Wilkinson, and Jason Ur. Reichel is revis-
ing his dissertation for publication and still hopes to send it off this year. 

——————————

Erica Reiner

As an invited panelist Erica Reiner presented a paper on “How to Reconstruct a Babylonian 
Treatise” in November 2001 at a three-day conference on Reconstructing Ancient Texts or-
ganized by Alexander Jones of University College, University of Toronto. The conference 
provided an occasion to make the acquaintance of the participants in the University of To-
ronto’s RIM project, and to renew contact with their current Assyriological faculty, some of 
whom had been students at the University of Chicago. 

A trip scheduled for October 2001 for Heidelberg was canceled owing to the uncertain 
international situation in the wake of the 11 September terrorist attack; the agenda of the 
meeting was eventually conducted via a conference call.

In March, Reiner sent to press a monograph that had occupied much of her time for the last 
several years; it is expected to appear during the year 2002.

A report on the Workshop on Babylonian Astronomy held in honor of Asger Aaboe’s 
eightieth birthday at Brown University in the last week of June 2002 will be postponed until 
the 2002/2003 Annual Report.

——————————

Robert K. Ritner

With an extensive series of public lectures, over a dozen media interviews, and a guided tour, 
Robert K. Ritner was often the visible face of the Oriental Institute during the past year. As 
detailed in the Oriental Institute’s News & Notes (Fall 2001, No. 171), Ritner served as the 
Academic Consultant for the sole American venue of the exhibit Cleopatra of Egypt: From 
History to Myth, displayed at Chicago’s Field Museum from 20 October 2001 until 3 March 
2002. The first comprehensive exhibit dedicated to the life and legends of the queen, Cleopa-
tra of Egypt drew more than 333,000 visitors, who encountered over 300 revised labels and 
charts, in addition to hieroglyphic banners and gift shop images, produced for the Chicago 
presentation. All of these were vetted by Ritner, who was also a commentator on the Acous-
tiguide recorded tour. At the Oriental Institute, two cases of objects from his personal collec-
tion (and that of John Larson) highlighted the Cleopatra of popular culture, complementing 
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a self-guided gallery tour of Ptolemaic artifacts devised in conjunction with Karen Wilson 
and Carole Krucoff.

In association with the exhibit, Ritner delivered lectures on “Cleopatra and the Ptolemies” 
to The Field Museum exhibit docents (12 September), The Field Museum Women’s Board (2 
October), the Exelon sponsor’s reception (23 October), the Egyptian Consulate (13 Novem-
ber), the University of Chicago Alumni Association (4 December), and the Breasted Society 
of the Oriental Institute (15 January). For a day-long Cleopatra seminar hosted by the Fort-
nightly Club of Chicago, he presented “Cleopatra’s Ancestors: The Ptolemaic Dynasty” (22 
October). As part of a joint lecture series between the Oriental Institute and Field Museum, 
Ritner provided two lectures held in Breasted Hall: an historical analysis “Cleopatra in Con-
text: A Princess Descended From So Many Royal Kings” (24 October), and a detailed survey 
of Cleopatra’s image in Western painting, music, sculpture, and popular culture “In Death 
Immortal: Cleopatra and her Legacy” (7 November). For the Classical Art Society of the Art 
Institute of Chicago, he spoke on “Cleopatra in History and Legend” (30 October). Each of 
these lectures drew capacity audiences, but all were surpassed by Ritner’s presentation “The 
Egypt of Cleopatra and the Ptolemaic Dynasty (332–330 bc)” for the Fermilab lecture series, 
which drew a “standing-room only” audience of over 850 listeners.

In addition to Cleopatra lectures, Ritner provided media interviews for television (ABC, 
CBS, WGN, CLTV), radio (NPR, WBBM), and print media (Associated Press, the Chicago 
Tribune, Sun-Times, Times of Indiana, Des Moines Register, Northwestern University Medill 
School of Journalism, Southwest Airlines Spirit Magazine, and various other free-lance jour-
nalists). One of his more unusual media duties was to provide expertise on Cleopatra questions 
to NBC studios for the television game show “The Weakest Link.” Media appearances were 
not limited to Cleopatra. On 3 April, the History Channel aired “Egypt: Land of the Gods. 
Part 4 — Magic,” an hour based on Ritner’s Oriental Institute publication, The Mechanics of 
Ancient Egyptian Magical Practice, with an extended personal interview. He is pleased to be 
one of the few individuals who can claim that his dissertation has been filmed. 

Invited lectures unrelated to the Cleopatra exhibit included six presentations on magic, 
religion, medicine, and hieroglyphs. He discussed “An Introduction to Ancient Egyptian 
Magic” for the South Suburban Archaeological Society (18 October). For the Chicago Hu-
manities Festival XII, he lectured at the Alliance Française on “The Living Image: Art and 
Text in Egyptian Hieroglyphs” (3 November). “Heka: The Magic of Ancient Egypt” was his 
topic at the Muscarelle Museum of Art at the College of William and Mary in Williamsburg, 
Virginia (15 November). At the annual meeting of the American Association of Neurological 
Surgeons in Chicago, he delivered “An Introduction to the Theory and Practice of the Egyptian 
Surgeon” (10 April). The Brown University Friends of Egyptology requested an overview of 
“Ancient Egyptian Magic” (12 April). Finally, Ritner concluded a Chicago alumni panel on 
Late Period Egypt at the fifty-third convention of the American Research Center in Egypt in 
Baltimore with a survey of “Egyptian Religion in the Late Period” (28 April). 

Following the closing of the Cleopatra exhibit, Ritner led the Oriental Institute tour to 
Egypt, where a decline in tourism allowed unhindered access to the sites. After the highly 
successful tour, he stayed on at Chicago House in Luxor to provide assistance with Ptolemaic 
inscriptions and to conduct personal research. 

Ritner’s publications for the year comprise a re-evaluation of the Joseph Smith Papyrus 
underlying the Mormon “Book of Abraham,” entitled “The ‘Breathing Permit of Hôr’ Thirty-
four Years Later” (Dialogue 33/4), and the News & Notes article mentioned above, “Cleopa-
tra in Chicago.” He completed his editorial duties on the forthcoming final volume of The 
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Context of Scripture; thirteen translations in The Literature of Ancient Egypt, to be published 
by Yale University Press, and, with the assistance of François Gaudard, the French version 
of his manuscript on “Evidence for Necromancy in Ancient Egypt,” to be published in the 
proceedings of the Louvre symposium, “La magie en Égypte: à la recherche d’une définition.” 

Ritner opened discussion at the second Oriental Institute retreat on 12 November, having 
been requested to provide a provocative report on “The Future of the Oriental Institute.” Other 
University committee service, student oversight, and teaching (six courses with contribu-
tion to a seventh) completed his academic year. He is the formal scholarly consultant for the 
forthcoming Field Museum exhibit “Eternal Egypt” (26 April–10 August 2003) and so will 
again be liaison between activities at The Field Museum and the Oriental Institute Museum. 

——————————

Martha T. Roth

Martha T. Roth continues to devote most of her scholarly energies to the Chicago Assyrian 
Dictionary (CAD) project (see separate report). During the 2001/2002 academic year, she 
also taught two quarters of the elementary Akkadian course, and two quarters on Alalakh texts 
to advanced students. She delivered a lecture at a conference on “Prostitution in the Ancient 
World” in Madison, Wisconsin, in April; the proceedings of that conference will appear in a 
volume published by Routledge Press.

Among the articles which appeared were two in festschrifts for CAD collaborators: “The 
Because Clause: Punishment Rationalization in Mesopotamian Laws,” in Veenhof Anniversary 
Volume: Studies Presented to Klaas R. Veenhof on the Occasion of His Sixty-Fifth Birthday, 
edited by W. H. van Soldt, pp. 407–12 (Leiden: Nederlands Instituut voor het Nabije Oosten, 
2001); and “ƒTaåmËtu-damqat and Daughters,” in Assyriologica et Semitica: Festschrift für 
Joachim Oelsner, pp. 387–400 (Alter Orient und Altes Testament 252; Münster: Ugarit-
Verlag, 2000). Another article, “Reading Mesopotamian Law Cases — PBS 5 100: A Question 
of Filiation,” Journal of the Economic and Social History of the Orient 44 (2001): 243–92, 
serves as an introduction to Roth’s volume in preparation, Mesopotamian Law Cases, to ap-
pear in the Writings from the Ancient World series.

Several articles in press will appear in festschrifts in the next year. Also in press is “Ham-
murabi’s Wronged Man,” in the Journal of the American Oriental Society, a revision of a 
paper presented at that society’s annual meeting in 2001.

In the autumn, Roth finished collecting publication information on and cataloging the 
cuneiform tablets in the Smith College Library, Northampton, Massachusetts, thanks to the 
generous access to the collection provided by Mr. Martin Antonetti, Curator of Rare Books, 
and Ms. Karen Kukil, Associate Curator of Rare Books. The cuneiform tablet collection had 
been transferred some years ago from the Religion Department to the Mortimer Rare Book 
Room, where the tablets are now properly conserved and stored; in the transition, however, 
documentation was lost and there was no possibility of keeping publication records up-to-date. 
With the cooperation of colleagues at Yale University, Professor W. W. Hallo and Ms. Ulla 
Kasten, Associate Curator of the Yale Babylonian Collection, Smith College now has accurate 
and current information on its tablet holdings. 

——————————
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